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Emmy is a first-year in Elm Yard
concentrating in Economics with a
secondary in Philosophy. She grew up in
the suburbs of Chicago and is a proud
graduate of North Shore Country Day
School, where she served as Student Body
President. On campus, Emmy is involved
in the Undergraduate Council, the
Institute of
Politics CIVICS and Policy Program, the
Arete Fellowship, and the Crimson, among
others. She hopes to continue exercising
critical and purposeful leadership during
her YLC experience and looks forward to
assisting high school students in
challenging conventional understandings
of leadership and empowering young
leaders to cultivate a strong sense of self
and community. Emmy staunchly believes
in instilling a sense of purpose in leaders
and ensuring that young people
understand what it is they are leading for
and whom they seek to represent in the
process. Emmy is a fan of all things cinema
and considers herself an instant ramen
aficionado.


